

# PRELIMINARY RESULTS

MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH  
 BID #19-083B  
 Purchase Telehandler  
 ANALYSIS SHEET

SET 1 of 2

<b>BIDDER</b>	WC Machinery <sup>CAT TL943D</sup>	CM I <sup>SORKEL SR9244</sup>
Signed Bid Form	OKg	OKg
Acknowledgement of Addendum (1)	OKg	OKg
Descriptive Literature	OKg	OKg

Schedule A

BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	BID PRICE		BID PRICE	
		Schedule A	Schedule C	Schedule A	Schedule C
A1	Model Year 2019 Telehandler per Bid Documents & Specifications (New & Unused)	150,494.00		117,500.00	
	<b>Alternates Schedules A &amp; C</b>				
AA A/C1	Light Material Bucket – 4 Yard	9,680.00	/	4,100.00	NO BID
AA A/C2	Pallet Forks 48"	Included	/	Included	
AA A/C3	Utility Forks – Minimum 72"	Included	/	2200.00	
AA A/C4	Man Lift	1,850.00	/	3800.00	
AA A/C5	Sweeper 96" Minimum	9,140.00	/	9,900.00	
AA A/C6	Stabilizers	Included	/	Included	

RECOMMENDATION: ALL BIDS TAKEN UNDER ADJUSTMENT

PURCHASING OFFICER

ASST PURCHASING OFFICER

BUYER

CONST PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST

DATE 4/22/19

WITNESS AC Alamo

WITNESS

WITNESS

# PRELIMINARY RESULTS

MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH  
 BID #19-083B  
 Purchase Telehandler  
 ANALYSIS SHEET

SET 1 of 2

<b>BIDDER</b>	NC Machinery	CMI
---------------	--------------	-----

Schedule B

BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	BID PRICE	BID PRICE
B1	Model Year 2015 Telehandler per Bid Documents & Specifications	NO Bid	NO Bid

Alternates Schedule B

AA B1	Light Material Bucket – 4 Yard	NO Bid	NO Bid
AA B2	Pallet Forks 48"	↓	↓
AA B3	Utility Forks – Minimum 72"		
AA B4	Man Lift		
AA B5	Sweeper 96" Minimum		
AA B6	Stabilizers		

Schedule C

Bid Item	DESCRIPTION	BID PRICE	BID PRICE
C1	Model Year 2019 Telehandler per Bid Documents & Specifications (New & Unused)	NO Bid	NO Bid

**RECOMMENDATION:** \_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_  
PURCHASING OFFICER

\_\_\_\_\_  
DATE

4/22/19

\_\_\_\_\_  
ASST PURCHASING OFFICER

\_\_\_\_\_  
WITNESS

AL [Signature]

\_\_\_\_\_  
BUYER

\_\_\_\_\_  
WITNESS

[Signature]

\_\_\_\_\_  
CONST PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST

\_\_\_\_\_  
WITNESS

# PRELIMINARY RESULTS

MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH  
 BID #19-083B  
 Purchase Telehandler  
 ANALYSIS SHEET

SET 2 of 2

BIDDER	INDEPENDENT LIFT TRUCKS	TECHNOLOGY INTERNATIONAL
Signed Bid Form	OKg SWORDZ SR 9244	OKg MANITOU MT 1440 TIRE IV
Acknowledgement of Addendum (1)	OKg	OKg
Descriptive Literature	OKg	OKg

Schedule A

BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	BID PRICE		BID PRICE <sup>150 DAYS</sup>		
		Schedule A	Schedule C	Schedule A	Schedule C	
A1	Model Year 2019 Telehandler per Bid Documents & Specifications (New & Unused)	129,990.00		<del>NO BID</del> 128,480.00		
<b>Alternates Schedules A &amp; C</b>		Schedule A	Schedule C	Schedule A	Schedule C	
AA A/C1	Light Material Bucket – 4 Yard	2,985.00	NO BID	Included		
AA A/C2	Pallet Forks 48"	Included	↓	↓		
AA A/C3	Utility Forks – Minimum 72"	4,272.00				
AA A/C4	Man Lift	3,845.00				
AA A/C5	Sweeper 96" Minimum	8,440.00				
AA A/C6	Stabilizers	Included				

RECOMMENDATION: All BIDS TALKED under ADVISORIAL

PURCHASING OFFICER: \_\_\_\_\_  
 DATE: 4/22/19  
 ASST PURCHASING OFFICER: [Signature]  
 WITNESS: \_\_\_\_\_  
 BUYER: [Signature]  
 WITNESS: \_\_\_\_\_  
 CONST PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST: \_\_\_\_\_  
 WITNESS: \_\_\_\_\_

# PRELIMINARY RESULTS

MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH  
 BID #19-083B  
 Purchase Telehandler  
 ANALYSIS SHEET

SET 2 of 2

<b>BIDDER</b>	INDEPENDENT LIFT Trucks TECHNOLOGY INTERNATIONAL Schedule B		
---------------	--	--	--

BID ITEM	DESCRIPTION	BID PRICE	BID PRICE
B1	Model Year 2015 Telehandler per Bid Documents & Specifications	NO BID	NO BID
<b>Alternates Schedule B</b>			
AA B1	Light Material Bucket - 4 Yard	NO BID	NO BID
AA B2	Pallet Forks 48"	↓	↓
AA B3	Utility Forks - Minimum 72"		
AA B4	Man Lift		
AA B5	Sweeper 96" Minimum		
AA B6	Stabilizers		

**Schedule C**

Bid Item	DESCRIPTION	BID PRICE	BID PRICE
C1	Model Year 2019 Telehandler per Bid Documents & Specifications (New & Unused)	129,990.00	NO BID

**RECOMMENDATION:** ALL BIDS TAKEN AS DISMISSED

\_\_\_\_\_  
 PURCHASING OFFICER  
 4/22/19  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 DATE

~~\_\_\_\_\_~~  
 ASST PURCHASING OFFICER  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 WITNESS

\_\_\_\_\_  
 BUYER  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 WITNESS

\_\_\_\_\_  
 CONST PROCUREMENT SPECIALIST  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 WITNESS