BID TABULATION
BID #20-075B

Purchase Signage & Sign Material

Bids Opened 1/6/2020 @ 4:30 PM

| | | |
BIDDER Newman Signs Warning Lites of Alaska Traffic Safety Supply Co Zumar Industries
Schedule A
Bid Item Description Quantity | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE [ TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE

1 New Traffic Pattern 36" x 36" 2 $57.26 $114.52 $90.00 $180.00 $68.80 $137.60 $86.50 $173.00 $0.00
2 Striping Ahead 30" x 30" 2 $32.77 $65.54 $62.50 $125.00 $48.34 $96.68 $70.75 $141.50 $0.00
3 Steam Thaw Truck Ahead 30" x 30" 4 $40.67 $162.68 $62.50 $250.00 $48.34 $193.36 $70.75 $283.00 $0.00
4 Loose Gravel 36" x 36" 5 $44.56 $222.80 $90.00 $450.00 $68.80 $344.00 $53.25 $266.25 $0.00
5 Stop Paddles 24" x 24" 8 $33.34 $266.72 $75.00 $600.00 $31.60 $252.80 $34.75 $278.00 $0.00
6 Detour Left 48" x 18" 2 $31.63 $63.26 $60.00 $120.00 $46.48 $92.96 $52.00 $104.00 $0.00
7 Detour Right 48" x 18" 2 $31.63 $63.26 $60.00 $120.00 $46.48 $92.96 $52.00 $104.00 $0.00
8 Marker w/ Stripes Left 12" x 36" 8 $18.75 $150.00 $30.00 $240.00 $24.16 $193.28 $22.75 $182.00 $0.00
9 Marker w/ Stripes Right 12" x 36" 8 $18.75 $150.00 $30.00 $240.00 $24.16 $193.28 $22.75 $182.00 $0.00
10 End of Roadway Marker 18" x 18" 6 $24.41 $146.46 $22.50 $135.00 $18.58 $111.48 $40.25 $241.50 $0.00
11 Stop Sign 30" x 30" 250 $32.77 $8,192.50 $55.00 $13,750.00 $33.08 $8,270.00 $46.75 $11,687.50 $0.00
12 Yield 30" x 30" 10 $19.32 $193.20 $55.00 $550.00 $21.73 $217.30 $46.75 $467.50 $0.00
13 4 - Way 12" x 6" 6 $7.56 $45.36 $10.00 $60.00 $8.56 $51.36 $13.50 $81.00 $0.00
14 Speed Limit 25 MPH 24" x 30" 60 $27.38 $1,642.80 $50.00 $3,000.00 $29.54 $1,772.40 $29.50 $1,770.00 $0.00
15 Speed Limit 55 MPH 24" x 30" $27.38 $82.14 $50.00 $150.00 $39.04 $117.12 $40.00 $120.00 $0.00
16 Reduce Speed Ahead 24" x 30" 4 $33.52 $134.08 $50.00 $200.00 $39.04 $156.16 $40.00 $160.00 $0.00
17 Road Closed 48" x 30" 10 $48.81 $488.10 $100.00 $1,000.00 $57.24 $572.40 $56.50 $565.00 $0.00
18 Road Closed to Thru Traffic 60" x 30" 8 $64.18 $513.44 $162.50 $1,300.00 $94.84 $758.72 $69.25 $554.00 $0.00
19 No Shooting From Roadway 48" x 24" 3 $51.03 $153.09 $80.00 $240.00 $61.36 $184.08 $76.00 $228.00 $0.00
20 Dumping Prohibited 30" x 14" 4 $24.82 $99.28 $37.50 $150.00 $23.54 $94.16 $46.75 $187.00 $0.00
21 90 Corner Left 30" x 30" 2 $32.77 $65.54 $62.50 $125.00 $48.34 $96.68 $46.75 $93.50 $0.00
22 90 Corner Right 30" x 30" 2 $32.77 $65.54 $62.50 $125.00 $48.34 $96.68 $46.75 $93.50 $0.00
23 Curve Left 30" x 30" 2 $32.77 $65.54 $62.50 $125.00 $48.34 $96.68 $53.25 $106.50 $0.00
24 Curve Right 30" x 30" 2 $32.77 $65.54 $62.50 $125.00 $48.34 $96.68 $53.25 $106.50 $0.00
25 Winding Road Right 36" x 36" 1 $44.56 $44.56 $90.00 $90.00 $68.80 $68.80 $73.25 $73.25 $0.00
26 Winding Road Left 36" x 36" 1 $44.56 $44.56 $90.00 $90.00 $68.80 $68.80 $73.25 $73.25 $0.00
27 Arrow 36" x 18" 10 $25.21 $252.10 $45.00 $450.00 $26.77 $267.70 $30.75 $307.50 $0.00
28 Double Arrow 36" x 18" 10 $25.21 $252.10 $45.00 $450.00 $26.77 $267.70 $30.75 $307.50 $0.00
29 Chevron 24" x 30" 11 $27.38 $301.18 $50.00 $550.00 $29.54 $324.94 $40.00 $440.00 $0.00
30 4 Way Intersection 30" x 30" 3 $32.77 $98.31 $62.50 $187.50 $48.34 $145.02 $53.25 $159.75 $0.00
31 T Intersection 30" x 30" 2 $32.77 $65.54 $62.50 $125.00 $48.34 $96.68 $53.25 $106.50 $0.00
32 Side Road Right 36" x 36" 2 $44.56 $89.12 $90.00 $180.00 $68.80 $137.60 $86.75 $173.50 $0.00
33 Side Road Left 36" x 36" 1 $44.56 $44.56 $90.00 $90.00 $68.80 $68.80 $86.75 $86.75 $0.00
34 T Intersection 30" x 30" 1 $32.77 $32.77 $62.50 $62.50 $48.34 $48.34 $70.75 $70.75 $0.00
35 Y Intersection 30" x 30" 1 $32.77 $32.77 $62.50 $62.50 $48.34 $48.34 $70.75 $70.75 $0.00
36 Roundabout 36" x 36" 5 $44.56 $222.80 $90.00 $450.00 $68.80 $344.00 $53.25 $266.25 $0.00
37 Road Narrows 36" x 36" 2 $32.77 $65.54 $90.00 $180.00 $68.80 $137.60 $73.25 $146.50 $0.00
38 Dip 30" x 30" 2 $32.77 $65.54 $62.50 $125.00 $48.34 $96.68 $73.25 $146.50 $0.00
39 Pavement Ends 30" x 30" 2 $44.56 $89.12 $62.50 $125.00 $48.34 $96.68 $86.75 $173.50 $0.00
40 Soft Shoulder 36" x 36" 4 $32.77 $131.08 $90.00 $360.00 $68.80 $275.20 $86.75 $347.00 $0.00
41 Rough Road 30" x 30" 10 $23.10 $231.00 $62.50 $625.00 $36.47 $364.70 $53.25 $532.50 $0.00
42 10 MPH 24" x 24" 12 $44.56 $534.72 $40.00 $480.00 $24.00 $288.00 $26.75 $321.00

43 Dead End 36" x 36" 20 $44.56 $891.20 $90.00 $1,800.00 $51.70 $1,034.00 $53.25 $1,065.00 $0.00
44 No Outlet 36" x 36" 10 $15.15 $151.50 $90.00 $900.00 $51.70 $517.00 $53.25 $532.50 $0.00
45 No Outlet w/Arrow Right 36" x 8" 10 $15.15 $151.50 $20.00 $200.00 $12.92 $129.20 $29.25 $292.50 $0.00
46 No Outlet w/Arrow Left 36" x 8" 10 $10.81 $108.10 $20.00 $200.00 $12.92 $129.20 $29.25 $292.50 $0.00
47 End 30" x 30" 6 $37.48 $224.88 $62.50 $375.00 $48.34 $290.04 $53.25 $319.50 $0.00
48 End Road ___ FT 36" x 36" 2 $57.26 $114.52 $90.00 $180.00 $68.80 $137.60 $86.75 $173.50

49 Bridge Closed 36" x 36" $57.26 $114.52 $90.00 $180.00 $68.80 $137.60 $86.75 $173.50

50 Watch for Ice 36" x 36" 4 $56.60 $226.40 $90.00 $360.00 $68.80 $275.20 $86.75 $347.00 $0.00
51 Water Over Roadway 36" x 36" 10 $46.96 $469.60 $90.00 $900.00 $51.70 $517.00 $53.25 $532.50 $0.00
57 Speed Humps 36" x 36" 10 $44.56 $445.60 $90.00 $900.00 $51.70 $517.00 $53.25 $532.50 $0.00
53 Road Closed 36" x 36" 10 $44.56 $445.60 $90.00 $900.00 $51.70 $517.00 $53.25 $532.50 $0.00

Total Schedule A $19,152.18 $34,937.50 $21,635.24 $26,771.50 $0.00 $0.00




Bidder

Schedule B1

Fiber Brite 6" x 24" Green Panel 200 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $0.00
2 Fiber Brite 6" x 30" Green Panel 200 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $0.00
Fiber Brite 6" x 36" Green Panel 160 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $0.00
Total Schedule B1 #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! $0.00 $0.00
Bidder Newman Signs Warning Lites of Alaska Traffic Safety Supply Co Zumar Industries
Schedule B2
1 Aluminum 6" x 24" Green Panel 200 $9.12 $1,824.00 $12.00 $2,400.00 $9.24 $1,848.00 $10.43 $2,086.00 $0.00
2 Aluminum 6" x 30" Green Panel 200 $9.98 $1,996.00 $15.00 $3,000.00 $9.87 $1,974.00 $12.06 $2,412.00 $0.00
3 Aluminum 6" x 36" Green Panel 160 $11.46 $1,833.60 $18.00 $2,880.00 $11.71 $1,873.60 $13.72 $2,195.20 $0.00
Total Schedule B2 $5,653.60 $8,280.00 $5,695.60 $6,693.20 $0.00 $0.00
| |
Bidder Newman Signs Warning Lites of Alaska Traffic Safety Supply Co Zumar Industries
Schedule C
1 | Application Tape 6.5" x 100 Yards | 16 No Bid #VALUE! $22.50 $360.00 $44.37 $709.92 No Bid #VALUE! $0.00
Total Schedule C #VALUE! $360.00 $709.92 #VALUE! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Bidder Newman Signs Warning Lites of Alaska Traffic Safety Supply Co Zumar Industries
Schedule D
1 2" x 2" x 10" Perforated Post 150 $34.38 $5,157.00 $48.00 $7,200.00 $37.87 $5,680.50 $54.00 $8,100.00 $0.00
2 2.5" x 30" Duty Anchor 150 $36.72 $5,508.00 $28.00 $4,200.00 $28.78 $4,317.00 $35.00 $5,250.00 $0.00
3 3" x 36 Heavy Duty Anchor 30 $37.93 $1,137.90 $41.00 $1,230.00 $45.31 $1,359.30 $45.00 $1,350.00 $0.00
4 3/8" Steel Drive Rivet w/Washer 2000 $0.62 $1,240.00 $0.85 $1,700.00 $0.56 $1,120.00 $0.85 $1,700.00 $0.00
Total Schedule D $13,042.90 $14,330.00 $12,476.80 $16,400.00 $0.00 $0.00




	Sched A

